
HOLIDAY PROVISIONS 

CRAFT/CLASSIFICATION 
Brick Tender  

ID 
102-X-9 

LOCALITY 
Alameda, Alpine, Amador, Butte, Calaveras, Colusa, Contra Costa, Del Norte, El 
Dorado, Fresno, Glenn, Humboldt, Kings, Lake, Lassen, Madera, Marin, Mariposa, 
Mendocino, Merced, Modoc, Monterey, Napa, Placer, Plumas, Sacramento, San Benito, 
San Francisco, San Joaquin, San Mateo, Santa Clara, Santa Cruz, Shasta, Sierra, 
Siskiyou, Solano, Sonoma, Stanislaus, Sutter, Tehama, Trinity, Tuolumne, Yolo and 
Yuba Counties 

HOLIDAYS 
Article XIV - Holidays – Make Up Day On Saturday 
Section 1. The following are the holidays recognized under this Agreement: New Year's 
Day, President's Day, Memorial Day, Independence Day, Labor Day, Thanksgiving Day, 
the Friday following Thanksgiving Day, Christmas Day and all Saturdays and Sundays. 
All work performed on Saturdays, and/or before shift begins and/or after shift ends shall 
be paid for at the rate of one and one-half (1½) times the straight-time hourly wage rate, 
except when the masons being tended are receiving double time, then, and in that 
event the mason tenders tending said masons shall also receive double time. All work 
performed on Sundays and Holidays shall be paid for at the rate of double the straight-
time hourly wage rate. If any of the above holidays fall on Sunday, the Monday following 
shall be considered a holiday. If any of the above holidays falls on a Saturday, that 
holiday shall be observed on the preceding Friday. Martin Luther King day will become 
recognized holiday when and if the five (5) basic Crafts adopt it as a Holiday. 

Section 2. In the event a crew is unable to work on a regular weekday due to weather, 
the Employer shall have the option to request this crew to work on the Saturday 
immediately following at the straight time rate. It is understood and agreed that the 
straight time rate shall apply only to workmen who did not work forty (40) hours during 
the week and in the event any workman exceeds forty (40) hours due to the make-up 
day on Saturday, said workman shall be paid time and one-half (1½) for all time worked 
in excess of forty (40) hours in any one (1) week. 
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